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ARTICLE  1 

NAME AND PRINCIPAL OFFICE 

 



(A)  Affiliate:  A group of alumni organized with an allegiance to a 
particular college or academic program within Marquette University, and 
recognized by the University as a chapter through Alumni Relations. 



SECTION 4.03:  The Association shall have the same fiscal year definition as the 
university, beginning July 1 and ending June 30. 
 
SECTION 4.04:  Marquette University, through Alumni Relations, has the exclusive and 
absolute right and power to amend, modify, alter or abolish these By-Laws with ten (10) 
days prior notice to the officers of the Board.  The Association, through its Board, may 
by resolution recommend amendments and modifications to Marquette University, which 
may approve or deny such amendment or modification in its sole discretion. 

SECTION 4.05:  The Board shall serve Marquette University in an advisory capacity.  
Working through Alumni Relations, the Board shall provide counsel in matters 
concerning the Association and its members, including, but not limited to, recognition of 
Chapters and benefits available to Association members including publications, reunions, 
service and social functions, and other events and programs. 

SECTION 4.06:  Any meeting of the Board or the Association, including committee 
meetings, may be conducted in accordance with the latest edition of Robert’s Rules of 

Order, except as set forth in and allowed by these By-Laws. 
 

 

ARTICLE 5 

MEMBERSHIP 

 
SECTION 5.01:  The membership of the Association shall be composed of those 
individuals who have completed twenty-four (24) credit hours and/or have received an 
honorary degree from Marquette University.  
  
SECTION 5.02:  There shall be no requirement that members pay dues to the Association 
or contribute to Marquette University.   
 
SECTION 5.03:  The Board and the board of any Chapter shall not be precluded from 
establishing expectations relating to contributions to Marquette University, subject to 
Alumni Relations approval. 
  
 

ARTICLE 6 

BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

 

SECTION 6.01:  The Association shall be managed by Alumni Relations under the 
counsel of the Board of Directors, which shall be composed of the three officers elected 
by the Board, one student representative, and up to fifteen (15) alumni directors.    The 
Executive Director of the Marquette University Alumni Association or the designee is an 
ex officio non-voting director.   
 
SECTION 6.02:  The terms of the directors of the Board shall be two (2) years, except for 
the student representative, whose shall be one (1) year.  No director may serve more than 



two (2) consecutive full terms, however, a director who is or will be serving in one (1) or 
more Association officer positions shall remain on the board while serving as an officer.   
Service that involves the completion of a term of a director that has resigned or otherwise 
left office before the expiration of a term shall not count towards fulfillment of either of 
the two (2) consecutive two-year terms. The terms of the directors shall be staggered so 
that approximately one-







process of all directors consistent with these By-Laws. In addition, this committee shall 
develop and administer the Board’s election process in consultation with the Executive 

Committee and Alumni Relations.  The Committee shall propose amendments to these 
By-Laws to the Board as it may deem appropriate. 




